
 
 
January 31, 2014 
 
Honorable Greg Walden 
Chairman, Subcommittee on Communications and Technology 
Committee on Energy and Commerce 
U.S. House of Representatives 
Washington, DC 20515 
 
Dear Chairman Walden: 
 
We write in response to your request for comments regarding an update to the 
Communications Act to foster more economic growth and innovation through 
communications and technology. Since 1973, the American Legislative Exchange 
Council has focused on providing practical policy answers to challenges facing America. 
State lawmakers are conquering today’s economic challenges by refocusing on our 
nation’s founding principles of limited government, free markets and federalism. 
 
The Exchange Council provides a unique opportunity for state legislators, business 
leaders and citizen organizations from around the country to develop model policies 
based on academic research, existing state policy and effective business practices. These 
policies are the result of task force research and debate, and are intended to be academic 
documents for individual study. While these state-based policy solutions are meant to 
facilitate economic growth, one size does not fit all. Legislators have the opportunity to 
determine, in consultation with their constituents and legislative colleagues, what works 
best for their communities. 
 
The Exchange Council’s Task Force on Communications and Technology, which we 
chair, is comprised of nearly 200 members representing all regions of the country and 
every segment of industry, who believe that constant, dynamic innovation in 
communications and technology presents numerous complexities that defy traditional 
public policy prescriptions. To help policymakers understand the changes underway in 
the 21st Century economy, the Task Force brings together state legislators, private 
industry and experts to develop public policies that will promote economic growth, 
freedom of technology and innovation in the states.  
 
We are pleased to provide you with the following six Principles for Communications and 
Technology, adopted by our Task Force in January 2013, as you consider how to update 
communications law. These principles serve as a guide for state policymakers, but speak 
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to universal ideas and could easily apply to issues facing policymakers at the federal 
level. The principles are as follows: 
 
1. THE FREE MARKET SHOULD DRIVE COMMUNICATIONS AND 
TECHNOLOGY POLICY 
 
Public policy relating to communications and technology should be driven by free market 
principles. The free market has enabled today’s Internet Protocol-based, broadband-
centric digital economy, which is increasingly characterized by disruptive change, vibrant 
competition, and consumer choice. Convergence is an ongoing feature of today’s 
communications and technology markets; the providers of products and services once 
considered separate now compete for the same end users. 
 
2. GOVERNMENT SHOULD STRIVE FOR COMPETITIVE AND 
TECHNOLOGICAL NEUTRALITY IN ITS POLICIES 
 
Public policy should remain neutral with respect to existing and emerging business 
models, and technologies. Additionally, government procurement policies should be 
transparent, non-discriminatory, openly pro-competitive, and performance-based. Rules 
should be based on desired results rather than preferred designs; in other words, designs 
of devices, software, or networks must not be dictated through governmental mandates. 
Government must not seek to create new technologies through regulation. 
 
3. CONSTITUTIONAL LIMITS AND PROTECTIONS SHOULD GUIDE 
GOVERNMENT POLICY AT ALL LEVELS.  
 
All limits on government power and all protections for individual rights contained in the 
federal and state constitutions must inform and apply to all government policies regarding 
communications and technology. Constitutional limits and rights do not cease applying 
where practices or conduct involves digital technology or takes place online. 
 
4. SELF-GOVERNANCE, CODES OF CONDUCT, AND OTHER VOLUNTARY 
INITIATIVES ARE PREFERRED METHODS FOR PURSUING SOLUTIONS TO 
NEW CHALLENGES; REGULATION SHOULD ONLY BE CONSIDERED 
WHERE MARKET COMPETITION FAILS AND REAL HARM EXISTS. 
 
Voluntary codes of conduct, industry-driven standards and individual empowerment 
should be preferred over government regulation. If there must be government regulation 
of communications and technology, it should only be in instances where actual harm 
results to consumers, and only then with the lightest touch necessary. Prophylactic 
regulation based on fears about future harms is unwarranted and inappropriate. Instead, 
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